














































































































































 
ST RALPH SHERWIN CATHOLIC MULTI ACADEMY TRUST

(A company limited by guarantee)
 

 
NOTES TO THE FINANCIAL STATEMENTS
FOR THE YEAR ENDED 31 AUGUST 2024

32. Related party transactions (continued)

Bishop Patrick McKinney and Reverend Cannon Paul Chipchase, both Members of the Academy Trust,
are also Members and Directors of the Nottingham Roman Catholic Diocesan Trustees (NRCDT).
NRCDT is the sole member of NRCDES and as such, given this connection, is considered to be a related
party of the Academy Trust. The Academy Trust rents a building from NRCDT under a formal lease
agreement which commenced on 29 September 2021 and operates for a period of 6 years. The building
is used as a nursery at St Edwards Catholic Academy. During the year ended 31 August 2024, the
Academy Trust paid rent under the lease agreement totalling £10,000 together with utilities service
charges totalling £2,667 (2023: rental of £10,000 plus utilities service charges of £8,322). The rental
payments under the lease with NRCDT are paid to the Parish of St. Peter and St Paul as reimbursement
for the up-front expenditure incurred by the Parish in making the premises fit for purpose as a nursery
setting. There were no amounts payable to NRCDT, via the Parish of St. Peter and St Paul at 31 August
2024 (2023: £Nil). The lease agreement with the NRCDT has been undertaken on an arms-length basis
and as well as having been notified to the DfE at the time of the establishment of the nursery at St
Edwards Catholic Academy as part of the change notifications submitted to the DfE. However, at the time
of entering into the lease agreement with NRCDT in September 2021, the Academy Trust omitted to
notify the ESFA in advance of the agreement commencing in line with the requirements of the Academy
Trust Handbook. Whilst no formal statement of assurance has been received, the trustees have satisfied
themselves that the rent and utilities service charges paid under the agreement with NRCDT are at no
more than cost. 

Bishop Patrick McKinney, Reverend Cannon Paul Chipchase, Rev Father Simon Gillespie and Mrs Laura
O'Brien, all members of the Academy Trust, are also members of Our Lady of Lourdes CMAT
(OLOLCMAT). St Ralph Sherwin Catholic MAT buys services from OLOLCMAT as part of a service level
agreement. Purchases during the year totalled £223,819 (2023: £235,131). The balance outstanding at
31 August 2024 was £71,627 (2023: £246,988). During the year St Ralph Sherwin Catholic MAT had also
recharged services totalling £Nil (2023: £2,027) to OLOLCMAT and the balance outstanding at 31 August
2024 was £Nil (2023: £2,027). 

Bishop Patrick McKinney is also a member of Nottingham Diocesan Catholic Youth Service. Purchases
during the year totalled £62,898 (2023: £62,898) and the balance outstanding at 31 August 2024 was
£5,396 (2022: £7,098).

Bishop Patrick McKinney, Reverend Cannon Paul Chipchase, Rev Father Simon Gillespie and Mrs Laura
O'Brien, all members of the Academy Trust, are also members St Thomas Aquinas CMAT. St Ralph
Sherwin Catholic MAT purchased services from St Thomas Aquinas CMAT during the year of £15,019
(2023: £3,455) and the balance outstanding at 31 August 2024 was £412 (2023: £48).
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